

C111971



The Assembly of the State of New York  
1 Enterprise Drive  
Albany, NY 12248  
Attn: Amy Metcalfe

March 15, 2019  
Client No. [REDACTED]  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

Orrick Contact: E. Joshua Rosenkranz

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through February 28, 2019 in connection  
with the matters described on the attached pages:

\$ 30,205.00

DISBURSEMENTS as per attached pages:

0.00

**TOTAL CURRENT FEES & DISBURSEMENTS (Pay this Amount):**

\$ 30,205.00

\$129,755.00

✓ (M)

Matter(s): [REDACTED] - Delgado v. State of New York Amicus

**DUE UPON RECEIPT**

ASSEMBLY  
RECEIVED

APR 22 2019

ACCOUNTS  
PAYABLE

The following is for information only:  
Previous Balance not included in this invoice: \$123,315.00  
If this amount has already been paid, please disregard.

In order to ensure proper credit to your account,  
please reference your **INVOICE** and **CLIENT** numbers on your remittance.  
For inquiries, call: (304) 231-2704. Fax (304) 231-2501.

Approval letter  
received on  
5/2/19.

**REMITTANCE COPY - PLEASE RETURN WITH PAYMENT**

**REMITTANCE ADDRESS:**

*Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP*

[REDACTED]

**ELECTRONIC FUNDS  
TRANSFERS:**

**ACH & Wire Transfers:**

[REDACTED]

*Wells Fargo  
420 Montgomery Street  
San Francisco, CA 94104  
Account of  
Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP*

[REDACTED]

**OVERNIGHT DELIVERY:**

*Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP*

[REDACTED]



The Assembly of the State of New York  
1 Enterprise Drive  
Albany, NY 12248  
Attn: Amy Metcalfe

March 15, 2019  
Client No. [REDACTED]  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

Orrick Contact: E. Joshua Rosenkranz

For Legal Services Rendered Through February 28, 2019 in Connection With:

[REDACTED] Delgado v. State of New York Amicus

02/12/19	E. Fallon	Review and analyze [REDACTED] draft re: [REDACTED]	2.70
02/12/19	A. Silverman	Review and analyze [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.20
02/14/19	E. Fallon	Review and analyze [REDACTED]; draft re: [REDACTED]	1.90
02/14/19	A. Silverman	Review and analyze [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] confer and correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.80
02/20/19	E. Fallon	Review [REDACTED] analyze [REDACTED] with [REDACTED] discuss [REDACTED]	2.20
02/20/19	A. Silverman	Review and analyze [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.50
02/25/19	A. Colella	Discuss [REDACTED] begin outlining [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]	1.70
02/25/19	E. Fallon	Review [REDACTED] review [REDACTED]	5.60
02/25/19	A. Silverman	Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.90
02/26/19	E. Fallon	Draft [REDACTED]	4.10



The Assembly of the State of New York - [REDACTED]  
page 2

March 15, 2019  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

02/27/19 A. Colella Conduct legal research for [REDACTED] 10.30

02/27/19 E. Fallon Draft [REDACTED] 4.40

02/28/19 R. Lyles Search [REDACTED] 1.80 *Remove*

02/28/19 A. Colella Perform [REDACTED] 10.70

02/28/19 E. Fallon Follow-up research on [REDACTED] review and finalize [REDACTED] 6.10

Total Hours 55.90 ✓

Total For Services \$30,205.00

**Timekeeper Summary**

Andrew D. Silverman  
Partner

Hours	Effective Rate	Amount	
4.40	550.00	2,420.00	✓
4.40	550.00	2,420.00	OK

Abigail Colella  
Ethan P. Fallon  
Associate

22.70	550.00	12,485.00	✓
27.00	550.00	14,850.00	✓
49.70	550.00	27,335.00	OK

Rachel A. Lyles  
Administrative Staff

<del>1.80</del>	<del>250.00</del>	<del>450.00</del>	✓
<del>1.80</del>	<del>250.00</del>	<del>450.00</del>	

Total All Timekeepers

55.90 \$540.34 \$30,205.00 ✓

Total For This Matter

\$30,205.00 ✓