



The Assembly of the State of New York  
1 Enterprise Drive  
Albany, NY 12248  
Attn: Amy Metcalfe

February 20, 2019  
Client No. [REDACTED]  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

Orrick Contact: Joshua Rosenkranz

FOR SERVICES RENDERED through January 31, 2019 in connection  
with the matters described on the attached pages:

\$ 123,315.00

DISBURSEMENTS as per attached pages:

0.00

**TOTAL CURRENT FEES & DISBURSEMENTS (Pay this Amount):**

\$ 123,315.00 ✓ OK (12)

Matter(s): [REDACTED] - Delgado v. State of New York Amicus

**DUE UPON RECEIPT**

ASSEMBLY  
RECEIVED  
APR 15 2019  
ACCOUNTS  
PAYABLE

In order to ensure proper credit to your account,  
please reference your **INVOICE** and **CLIENT** numbers on your remittance.  
For inquiries, call: (304) 231-2704. Fax (304) 231-2501.

Waiting on  
Approval letter  
OK msl/lyg (12)

**REMITTANCE COPY - PLEASE RETURN WITH PAYMENT**

**REMITTANCE ADDRESS:**

Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP  
[REDACTED]

**ELECTRONIC FUNDS  
TRANSFERS:**

**ACH & Wire Transfers:**  
[REDACTED]

Wells Fargo  
420 Montgomery Street  
San Francisco, CA 94104  
Account of  
Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP  
[REDACTED]

**OVERNIGHT DELIVERY:**

Orrick, Herrington & Sutcliffe LLP  
[REDACTED]



The Assembly of the State of New York  
1 Enterprise Drive  
Albany, NY 12248  
Attn: Amy Metcalfe

February 20, 2019  
Client No. [REDACTED]  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

Orrick Contact: Joshua Rosenkranz

For Legal Services Rendered Through January 31, 2019 in Connection With:

[REDACTED] - Delgado v. State of New York Amicus

12/17/18	A. Colella	Review [REDACTED] review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	2.30
12/18/18	A. Colella	Prepare for and attend call with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] investigate [REDACTED] [REDACTED] begin review [REDACTED]	4.20
12/18/18	A. Silverman	Call with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.50
12/19/18	A. Colella	Research [REDACTED] [REDACTED] summarize [REDACTED] review [REDACTED] review [REDACTED]	4.70
12/20/18	A. Colella	Confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] research [REDACTED] request [REDACTED] [REDACTED] work with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	4.90
12/20/18	E. Fallon	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] meeting with [REDACTED] to discuss [REDACTED]	3.30
12/20/18	A. Silverman	Confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.90



The Assembly of the State of New York - [REDACTED]  
page 2

February 20, 2019  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

12/21/18	A. Colella	Research [REDACTED] attend call with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] review [REDACTED] work with [REDACTED] to set up [REDACTED]	7.10
12/21/18	E. Fallon	Phone call with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] research [REDACTED]	4.80
12/21/18	A. Silverman	Review [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] correspond and confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	7.50
12/22/18	A. Colella	Draft [REDACTED]	10.20
12/24/18	E. Fallon	Legal research on [REDACTED] review and analyze [REDACTED]	4.20
12/26/18	M. Abrams	Update formatting [REDACTED]	1.00 (Para)
12/26/18	A. Colella	Draft [REDACTED]	7.20
12/26/18	E. Fallon	Draft section on [REDACTED]	4.80
12/27/18	A. Colella	Draft [REDACTED]	6.80
12/27/18	E. Fallon	Draft section on [REDACTED]	6.60
12/28/18	A. Colella	Draft [REDACTED]	6.00
12/28/18	E. Fallon	Draft and review [REDACTED]	6.50
12/29/18	E. Fallon	Draft [REDACTED] review and implement [REDACTED]	5.20
12/30/18	A. Silverman	Draft, review, and revise [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	3.00
12/31/18	A. Colella	Confer with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] research [REDACTED]	1.80



The Assembly of the State of New York - [REDACTED]  
page 3

February 20, 2019  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

12/31/18	E. Fallon	Research [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review [REDACTED]	4.10
12/31/18	A. Silverman	Review and comment on [REDACTED] review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	6.80
01/01/19	E. Fallon	Update [REDACTED]	2.20
01/01/19	A. Silverman	Draft, review, and revise [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	9.20
01/02/19	A. Colella	Confer with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] revise and update [REDACTED]	5.10
01/02/19	E. Fallon	Update [REDACTED] research [REDACTED]	3.90
01/02/19	A. Silverman	Draft, review, and revise [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	5.20
01/03/19	M. Abrams	Prepare shells [REDACTED]	1.10 (Para)
01/03/19	A. Colella	Prepare for and attend [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] with [REDACTED] implement [REDACTED] [REDACTED] draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED] with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED]; confer	11.70
01/03/19	E. Fallon	Phone call with [REDACTED] meeting with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] research [REDACTED] [REDACTED] draft [REDACTED] review and implement [REDACTED]	5.60
01/03/19	A. Silverman	Prepare for and participate in [REDACTED] with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] correspond and confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] review and revise [REDACTED]	1.60
01/04/19	M. Abrams	Bluebook and cite check [REDACTED]	2.30 (Para)
01/04/19	A. Colella	Revise [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED]	2.10



The Assembly of the State of New York - [REDACTED]  
page 4

February 20, 2019  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

01/04/19	E. Fallon	Follow-up research on [REDACTED] edit and update [REDACTED]	4.30
01/04/19	A. Silverman	Draft, review, and revise [REDACTED] [REDACTED] correspond and confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	4.20
01/05/19	M. Abrams	Bluebook and cite check [REDACTED]	2.50 (Para)
01/05/19	A. Silverman	Review and revise [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.20
01/06/19	A. Colella	Conduct substantive cite check [REDACTED] review [REDACTED]	3.20
01/06/19	A. Silverman	Review, revise, and finalize [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.80
01/07/19	M. Abrams	Check [REDACTED] prepare [REDACTED] finalize [REDACTED] [REDACTED] coordinate [REDACTED]	4.70 (Para)
01/07/19	A. Colella	Review [REDACTED]; work with [REDACTED] to finalize [REDACTED]	3.60
01/07/19	E. Fallon	Review and cite check [REDACTED]; prepare [REDACTED]	2.20
01/07/19	A. Silverman	Finalize [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.10
01/08/19	M. Abrams	Prepare [REDACTED] serve [REDACTED] to court.	1.40 (Para)
01/08/19	A. Colella	Confer with [REDACTED] regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40
01/08/19	A. Silverman	Review and annotate [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.40
01/09/19	E. Fallon	Prepare files for [REDACTED] discuss and update regarding [REDACTED]	0.60
01/09/19	A. Silverman	Correspond and confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.20



The Assembly of the State of New York - [REDACTED]  
page 5

February 20, 2019  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

01/10/19	A. Colella	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] and discuss with [REDACTED]	1.30
01/10/19	E. Fallon	Review [REDACTED] assist [REDACTED] with [REDACTED]; research and review [REDACTED]	3.60
01/10/19	A. Silverman	Prepare [REDACTED] confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review and annotate [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	11.30
01/11/19	A. Colella	Discuss [REDACTED] [REDACTED] discuss [REDACTED] with [REDACTED]	0.40
01/11/19	A. Silverman	Prepare for and attend preliminary injunction hearing; debrief with [REDACTED] correspond and debrief with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	5.50
01/12/19	E. Fallon	Research [REDACTED]	2.20
01/28/19	A. Silverman	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] cause [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review and annotate [REDACTED]	2.80
01/29/19	A. Colella	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] prepare for and attend [REDACTED] with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.90
01/29/19	E. Fallon	Review and analyze [REDACTED]	1.60
01/29/19	A. Silverman	Confer with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.10
01/30/19	A. Silverman	Review [REDACTED]; correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.20
01/31/19	A. Silverman	Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.20



The Assembly of the State of New York [REDACTED]  
page 6

February 20, 2019  
Invoice No. [REDACTED]

Total Hours 231.30  
Total For Services \$123,315.00

**Timekeeper Summary**

Andrew D. Silverman  
Partner

Hours	Effective Rate	Amount
67.70	550.00 <i>OK</i>	37,235.00
67.70	550.00	37,235.00

Abigail Colella  
Ethan P. Fallon  
Associate

84.90	550.00	46,695.00
65.70	550.00 <i>OK</i>	36,135.00
150.60	550.00	82,830.00

Michael S. Abrams  
Paralegal

13.00 ✓	250.00 <i>OK</i>	3,250.00
13.00	250.00	3,250.00

Total All Timekeepers

231.30 \$533.14 \$123,315.00

Total For This Matter

\$123,315.00 ✓

*OK*  
*OK*